




4. A description of any contract
for goods, services or works
made between your authority
and you or the persons
referred to above ( or a body in
which you or they have a
beneficial interest) and which
has not been fully dischan::ied

5. Any land in your authority's
area in which you have a
beneficial interest

This would include 
home/property ownership. 

6. Any tenancy where to your
knowledge the landlord is
your authority and the tenant is
a body in which you or a
person referred to above has a
beneficial interest

This is for Council tenants to 
declare. 

7. Any land in the authority's
area for which you or the
persons referred to above
have a licence (alone or jointly
with others) to occupy for a
month or longer

This is for private Rental 
Tenants. 

Please tick here If you 

ca have nothing to declare 
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Pl ase tic here If you 

□ have nothing to declare • 

Please tick here If you 

[2J have nothing to declare 

[2] Please tick here If you 
have nothing to declare 
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